
2012 CBRL Ballast Bid

Item # Alt Code Details to Specify per
Description 

1 A1 EA 50,300 tons No Bid
2 B1 EA 10,500 tons No Bid
3 B2 EA 9,400 tons No Bid
4 B3 EA 7,200 tons No Bid
5 B4 EA 8,000 tons  $          29.93  $      239,440.00 
6 B5 EA 4,900 tons  $          25.79  $      126,371.00 
7 B6 EA 7,000 tons  $          24.79  $      173,530.00 
8 B7 EA 3,300 tons  $          24.79  $        81,807.00 

Item # Alt Code Details to Specify per
Description 

1 A1 EA 50,300 tons  $          13.90  $      699,170.00 
2 B1 EA 10,500 tons  $          22.50  $      236,250.00 
3 B2 EA 9,400 tons  $          23.75  $      223,250.00 
4 B3 EA 7,200 tons  $          25.50  $      183,600.00 
5 B4 EA 8,000 tons  $          26.75  $      214,000.00 
6 B5 EA 4,900 tons  $          25.50  $      124,950.00 
7 B6 EA 7,000 tons  $          29.75  $      208,250.00 
8 B7 EA 3,300 tons  $          32.50  $      107,250.00 

Railroad Ballast

Railroad Ballast

Godfrey & Yeager Excavating Inc.

TotalUM Bid Qty Unit Price

UM Bid Qty Unit Price

Coburg Road Quarry

Total
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2012 CBRL Ballast Bid

Item # Alt Code Details to Specify per
Description 

1 A1 EA 50,300 tons No Bid
2 B1 EA 10,500 tons $          16.30 $      171,150.00 
3 B2 EA 9,400 tons  $          18.90  $      177,660.00 
4 B3 EA 7,200 tons  $          18.90  $      136,080.00 
5 B4 EA 8,000 tons  $          18.90  $      151,200.00 
6 B5 EA 4,900 tons  $          18.90  $        92,610.00 
7 B6 EA 7,000 tons  $          18.90  $      132,300.00 
8 B7 EA 3,300 tons  $          18.90  $        62,370.00 

Item # Alt Code Details to Specify per
Description 

1 A1 EA 50,300 tons  $            7.45  $      374,735.00 
2 B1 EA 10,500 tons  $          15.64  $      164,220.00 
3 B2 EA 9,400 tons  $          18.34  $      172,396.00 
4 B3 EA 7,200 tons  $          21.34  $      153,648.00 
5 B4 EA 8,000 tons  $          19.80  $      158,400.00 
6 B5 EA 4,900 tons  $          17.55  $        85,995.00 
7 B6 EA 7,000 tons  $          15.75  $      110,250.00 
8 B7 EA 3,300 tons  $          15.50  $        51,150.00 

Babb Construction Co. DBA Delta Construction Co. & Delta Concrete

Knife River

Total

Railroad Ballast

UM Bid Qty Unit Price

TotalUM Bid Qty Unit Price

Railroad Ballast
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2012 CBRL Ballast Bid

Item # Alt Code Details to Specify per
Description 

1 A1 EA 50,300 tons  $          18.79  $      945,137.00 
2 B1 EA 10,500 tons No Bid
3 B2 EA 9,400 tons No Bid
4 B3 EA 7,200 tons  $          26.85  $      193,320.00 
5 B4 EA 8,000 tons  $          23.45  $      187,600.00 
6 B5 EA 4,900 tons  $          19.65  $        96,285.00 
7 B6 EA 7,000 tons  $          18.90  $      132,300.00 
8 B7 EA 3,300 tons  $          18.79  $        62,007.00 

Laskey Clifton Corp.

UM Bid Qty Unit Price Total

Railroad Ballast
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2012 CBRL Ballast Bid

2012 Railroad Ballast ITB TOTAL BID FOR
BIDDER A1 B1 B2 B3 B4 B5 B6 B7 ALT B1-B7
Godfrey & Yeager Excavating, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $239,440.00 $126,371.00 $173,530.00 $81,807.00 N/A
Coburg Road Quarry $699,170.00 $236,250.00 $223,250.00 $183,600.00 $214,000.00 $124,950.00 $208,250.00 $107,250.00 $1,297,550.00
Babb Construction Co. DBA Delta 
Const. Co./Delta Concrete No Bid $171,150.00 $177,660.00 $136,080.00 $151,200.00 $92,610.00 $132,300.00 $62,370.00 $923,370.00
Knife River $374,735.00 $164,220.00 $172,396.00 $153,648.00 $158,400.00 $85,995.00 $110,250.00 $51,150.00 $896,059.00
Laskey Clifton Corp. $945,137.00 No Bid No Bid $193,320.00 $187,600.00 $96,285.00 $132,300.00 $62,007.00 N/A

Recommended Award
Total Amount: $871,291.00

BID ALTERNATIVE
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